
Bidder Bid Amount Award Amount

J. E. Foss Company Inc. $5,460.00 $2,645.00

Kurtz Brothers $10,217.90 $0.00

Office Basics $5,989.85 $675.85

Standard Stationary No Bid

Total Video No Bid

Valiant No Bid

W. B. Mason $3,732.15 $2,903.00

Warehouse Battery Outlet $1,656.00 $0.00

Total $6,223.85

 

Steve Skrocki

Director of Business Administration

4/10/18

Recommend bid award to the above companies in the amounts listed above based on the lowest responsible 

bid of specified items. Award represents anticipated purchases to be stored in the warehouse.

Bid Award Summary

AV Supplies 2018-2019

April 19, 2018 Board Meeting

Bid Opening:  Friday, March 9, 2018 - 10:00 am



Bidder Bid Amount Award Amount

Kurtz Bros. $71,252.05 $7,626.90

National Art & School Supplies $26,355.00 $3,659.00

Office Basics, Inc. $39,424.20 $10,098.25

School Specialty, Inc. $52,854.20 $9,303.20

The Art Store $27,315.75 $4,748.00

WB Mason $50,529.35 $13,778.25

Total $49,213.60

 

Steve Skrocki

Director of Business Administration

4/10/18

Recommend bid award to the above companies in the amounts listed above based on the lowest responsible 

bid of specified items. Award represents anticipated purchases to be stored in the warehouse.

Bid Award Summary

General Supplies 2018-2019

April 19, 2018 Board Meeting

Bid Opening:  Friday, March 9, 2018 - 2:00 pm



Bidder Bid Amount Award Amount

Moore Medical $6,038.87 $3,637.57

School Health LLC $7,790.90 $2,326.70

Medical Source, Inc. No bid

Henry Schein, Inc. No bid

School Nurse Supply No bid

William V. MacGill & Do. No bid

Total $5,964.27

 

Steve Skrocki

Director of Business Administration

4/10/18

Recommend bid award to the above companies in the amounts listed above based on the lowest responsible 

bid of specified items. Award represents anticipated purchases to be stored in the warehouse.

Bid Award Summary

Nursing Supplies 2018-2019

April 19, 2018 Board Meeting

Bid Opening:  Friday, March 16, 2018 - 2:00 pm



Bidder Bid Amount Award Amount

Kurtz Bros. $21,765.35 $1,289.43

National Art & School Supplies $9,920.50 $2,823.30

Office Basics, Inc. $6,622.80 $535.00

Pyramid School Products, Inc. $11,485.23 $500.13

S&S Worldwide $1,739.22 $0.00

School Specialty, Inc. $20,589.58 $4,455.71

The Art Store $8,268.40 $5,269.45

WB Mason $13,316.97 $3,164.73

Total $18,037.75

 

Steve Skrocki

Director of Business Administration

4/10/18

Recommend bid award to the above companies in the amounts listed above based on the lowest responsible 

bid of specified items. Award represents anticipated purchases to be stored in the warehouse.

Bid Award Summary

Art Supplies 2018 - 2019

April 19, 2018  Board Meeting

Bid Opening:  Friday, March 9, 2018 - 2:00 pm
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